Re: Duckworth Consulting Invoice
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Subject: Re: Duckworth Consulting Invoice

From: Donald Duckworth <duckworth.donald@gmail.com>
Date: 02/08/2018 09:44 PM

To: Moises Gomez <moises@lani.org>

Attached is a copy of the Invoice Mo. Thanks for your timely follow-up.

On Wed, Feb 7, 2018 at 9:54 AM, Moises Gomez <moises@lani.org <mailto:moises@lani.org> >
wrote:

Hello Don,

Got a status update for you.

The invoice is in process and is due to be cut on the Feb. 12th. Give or take a
couple of days for signatures and it should be ready for you by the middle of the month.

Also, can it be possible for you to forward me a copy of the complete invoice for
my records?

Sincerely,

Moises

From: Moises Gomez [mailto:moegomez@gmail.com <mailto:moegomez@gmail.com> ]
Sent: Wednesday, February 07, 2018 9:47 AM

To: Moises Gomez <moises@lani.org <mailto:moises@lani.org> >

Subject: Fwd: Duckworth Consulting Invoice

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Moises Gomez <moegomez@gmail.com <mailto:moegomez@gmail.com> >

Date: February 3, 2018 at 6:05:56 PM PST

To: Donald Duckworth <duckworth.donald@gmail.com
<mailto:duckworth.donald@gmail.com> >

Cc: Moises Gomez <moises@lani.org <mailto:moises@lani.org> >

07/20/2018 07:58 AM



Re: Duckworth Consulting Invoice

Subject: Re: Duckworth Consulting Invoice
Hello Don,
I will check on Monday morning to see if it was submitted and in process.

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 3, 2018, at 8:40 AM, Donald Duckworth
<duckworth.donald@gmail.com <mailto:duckworth.donald@gmail.com> > wrote:

Good morning Mo. During our meeting yesterday I forgot to ask if
you were aware of the progress payment invoice that I had submitted to Darin last week.
Our objective was for him to process it before he left town. But maybe that didn't happen
so I need to raise it with you. Let me know how I can help. Thank you.

— Attachments:
Invoice Letterl BLQ 180126.doc 50.0 KB
HOURS BLQ PICO PBID 170320 180126.pdf 148 KB
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